6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200 » FAX (607) 334-9848

COOPERATIVE
PURCHASING

MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS & SHEET MUSIC
BID #2023-107

DCMO BOCES INFORMATION

142 Whaupaunaucau Rd
Norwich, NY 13815
Contact: Ginger Bennett
Phone #: 607-335-1412
bennettg@dcmoboces.com

Bid Prices Expire on April 30, 2024




6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200 « FAX (607) 334-9848

To: Participating Districts
From: Ginger Bennett
Date: May 1, 2023

Re: Cooperative Purchasing Musical Instruments & Sheet Music Bid Awards #2023-107

RESULTS & AWARDS:
The bid was opened on March 27, 2023 and resulted in ten bid submissions. Two bid submissions were
rejected due to the exceptions taken within the bid document.

On April 5, 2023, the bid award recommendations were presented to the DCMO BOCES Board. The bid
award recommendations were approved and awarded by the Board.

Please see the attached “Musical Instruments & Sheet Music Bid Awards” in a PDF format. These are the
results of the bid award recommendations. Any district in the service may take advantage of this award,
even if the district did not participate in the initial requisitioning of items. The vendor contact sheet will
give you additional information regarding the awarded bidder, such as the address, phone number, contact
person, etc.

Please make sure your PO’s include the Bid Number 2023-107

IMPORTANT BID INFORMATION:
Please note that according to our contract the awarded vendors must follow these terms:

e Must deliver and invoice within 35 days from the date the vendor confirms they received the
purchase order. (If a vendor fails to deliver in this time, please contact our office, as we may
implement the Buy Against Clause)

Pricing is firm until 4/30/24.

Must provide the brand they specified on the bid throughout the bid contract.

Must not substitute any item unless they have advance approval from the district.

Cannot say an item is discontinued or no longer available, and offer you a higher priced item. —
PLEASE CONTACT US IMMEDIATELY - Substitutions must be at the bid price.

Must not include shipping, handling or fuel surcharges on any order meeting minimum.

You can combine orders for other items not on bid with any purchase order containing bid items
to reach the minimum ordering amount (if applicable).

DISCOUNTS:

The vendors who offer discounts off their website or catalog are listed below. If the item you need is not
within this bid, you can search for the item utilizing the discounts from the vendors to ensure that you are
getting the best possible price. Sometimes a 15% discount from one vendor is better than a 20% discount
from another vendor but you must do your research and also look at minimum order amounts. Please
review the discount analysis for further information.
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NO BID ITEMS/REJECTED ITEMS

If you see any price that shows as $0.00 on any reports or online this means the item in question did NOT
RECEIVE A BID. The item was either discontinued or not available from the vendors who provided a
bid. The No Bid items may have a suitable substitution within the bid awards.

PRODUCT QUALITY / VENDOR ISSUE RESOLUTION PROCESS:

If you have a Product Quality problem or Vendor Issue, please follow the process below:

1. Call the vendor contact person. Note the date and time you called about the issue. Make sure to
have them give you a time or date that the problem will be resolved. Make sure you get the
person’s name and their phone number.

2. If the problem is not resolved or the person you spoke to is not responsive to correcting the
problem, please email us the information below:
a. Details of the problem
The company you having an issue with
The PO Number and/or Invoice number
Your customer number
The person’s name at the company you spoke to about the issue and their phone #
Variance form

me a0 o

Once we have the information we will work with the vendor and copy you on the email. If you need to
speak with us for any reason, you can email us at cooppur@dcmoboces.com. Feel free to call or email us
with your issues or concerns. We will try our best to get it sorted!

READING THE PDF AWARDS:
To search the PDF, there is a “find” box in the tool bar or use CTL & F on your keyboard. A search bar
will appear and from there you can type in any keyword to find the items you are looking for.


mailto:cooppur@dcmoboces.com
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Vendor Contact Information

Vendor Contact Phone & Fax Min Order
Alamo Music Center David Cleckler P: 210-538-9521
425 N. Main Ave Schoolbids@alamomusic.com F: 210-226-8742 None
San Antonio, TX 78205 .
www.alamomusic.com
Baroque Violin Shop David Smarelli P: 513-206-8978
1038 W. North Bend Rd. david@baroqueviolinshop.com | F: 513-541-2019 $25.00 min
Cincinnati, OH 45224 .
www.baroqueviolinshop.com
Loser's Music, Inc Janice Matquette P: 800-522-2600
728 Cumberland St losers@Imf.net F: 717-272-6426 None
Lebanon, PA 17042 .
www.losersmusic.com
Music in Motion Customer Service Dept. P: 800-445-0649
1601 E Plano Pkwy orders@musicmotion.com F: 866-943-8906 $25.00 min
STE 100 WWWw.musicmotion.com
Plano, TX 75074
Music Wagon Scott Abrahamson P: 508-252-6222
166 School St driver@themusicwagon.com None
Rehoboth, MA 02769 .
www.themusicwagon.com
Shar Products Co. Jonathan Peters P: 866-742-7261
2465 S. Industrial Hwy schools@sharmusic.com None
Ann Arbor, MI 48104 .
www.sharmusic.com
Taylor Music Mary McKinney P: 800-872-2263
513 S. Main St Mary@taylormusic.com F: 605-225-2051 $25.00 min
Aberdeen, SD 57401 .
www.taylormusic.com
West Music Beth Villhauer P: 800-397-9378
1212 5th St bids@westmusic.com F: 888-470-3942 None
PO Box 5521 www.westmusic.com

Coralville, IA 52241
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Discounts Offered for Items NOT on Bid

Vendor

Discount %

Applies to:

Exceptions:

Baroque Violin

*String Instruments

*$25.00 Min order for free shipping

o x . e
Shop 50% Website & master catalog Brazilwood bows & model 2001 violin/viola
cases
Loser’s Music 25% *Website & Catalog *No min for free shipping
*Online ordering not allowed for this bid.
West Music 10% *Website Price *Exceptions: Free shipping except on items with

oversize shipping rates




Fender Rumble 25 1x8 25W Bass Combo Amp

600791

$99.72

Amplifiers - Rogue Guitar V15G 15 Amp

Gold Tone AC-1 Acoustic Composite 5-String
Openback Banjo with Gig Bag

306476

$0.00

$201.87

BE1062

EACH Rogue Banjo 26936 $0.00

SET Gibson Earl Scruggs Signature Medium Banjo 38985 $0.00
Strings ‘

EACH Baritone - Jupiter JBR700, Bb Student Horn, 26966 2538403 $899.00 | F.E. OLDS NA340 The Music Wagon
Lacquered Brass Body

EACH Baritone - Yamaha YEP-321 27732 2538403 $899.00 | F.E. OLDS NA340 The Music Wagon

EACH Euphonium - Yamaha 3 Valve Brass Finish 26568 2538403 $1,063.00 | F.E. OLDS NA370 The Music Wagon
w/Hard Case - YEP 201

EACH Euphonium - Ravel 3-Valve - EUPREP203 34550A 2538403 $1,063.00 | F.E. OLDS NA370 The Music Wagon

EACH Euphonium - Besson Student, Silver Plated - 26399 2538403 $1,375.00 | F.E OLDS NA370S The Music Wagon

SET 5A Vic Firth Drum Sticks 202406 255923 $10.89 West Music

EACH Rhythm Club Floor Tom Drum, 10" - Remo Rh 49709 200746 $28.31 West Music
5010-00

EACH Snare Drum - Yamaha Concert 14 X 5.5" Steel 26532 $299.97 Alamo Music Center
Shell - CSS1450A

EACH Bass Drum - 18" Power-Lite, White Shell with 26466 $449.97 Alamo Music Center
RMP-LB Carrier - MB6118XW

EACH Snare Drum - 13" Yamaha Power Lite, 26462 $609.97 Alamo Music Center
Marching and Carrier - MS6213

EACH Ludwig LE-788 Suspended Bass Drum Stand 37508 $679.97 Alamo Music Center

EACH Bass Drum - Ludwig LECB86-X8 26489 $1,559.97 Alamo Music Center

EACH Ludwig Bass - Drum Stand 26490 $0.00

EACH Snare Drum - Ludwig - LM410 26495 $0.00




EACH Snare Drum - Dynasty 14" Wedge Marching w/ | 26956 $0.00
T-Bar Carrier & Case
SET Drum Set - Pearl Export EXX725 Standard 26957 $0.00
Package - 5/Set
EACH Drum Sticks 5A 26971 $0.00
EACH EZ Straps PA464EZ 34106 $0.00
SET 10 & 12" Tom Set - Pearl Concert Toms with 34108 $0.00
stand
SET 13 & 14" Tom Set - Pearl Concert Toms with 34109 $0.00
stand
EACH 14" Remo Ambassador Coated Drum Head - 34112 $0.00
BAO114
EACH 10" Remo Ambassador Coated Drum Head - 34113 $0.00
BAO110
EACH Wood Bass Drum Hoop Guard 34114 $0.00
EACH 8" Remo Practice Pad and Stand 37509 $0.00
PKG 5B Drum Sticks Value Pack-4 Pair, Vic Firth 49687 $0.00
VP5B35B1X-P
EACH Yamaha FP7210A Single Bass Drum Pedal - 51461 $0.00
YFP7210XX
SET Drum Sticks, Maple 7A - 12 Pairs 51526 $0.00
EACH Pearl Bass Drum Chain Drive Single Pedal - 55868 $0.00
P930
EACH Reeds - Bassoon - Jones Medium Soft 26939 Jones MedSoft $12.66 Taylor Music Inc.
Bassoon
EACH Kids Play 8-Note Deskbell Set with Case 264700 MIM# 99546 $99.00 Music In Motion
EACH Suzuki ToneChimes HB 250, 2 Octave 341200 MIM# 2245 $1,510.92 Music In Motion
Chromatic Set G4 to G6
EACH Bongos - Rhythm Band RB103 Large School 26952 26058 $79.00 | tunable bongos; 6 " and 6 3/4" Music In Motion
heads; wooden w/ tunable
natural rawhide heads; black
powder coated hardware; amber
finish; 8 tuning lugs.
EACH Stand - Bongos - Matador M245 Stand 26981 255509 $145.34 West Music
EACH Bongos - Matador M201 26980 200298 $177.64 West Music




EACH Easy Ukulele Songs by Denise Gagne - 49680 21584 $8.00 Music In Motion
Students' Edition
EACH West Music - Carnival of the Animals Book 202454 7102 $19.99 | book & cd Music In Motion
EACH From Ragtime to Rock DVD/CD ROM 10641000 25010 $24.95 Music In Motion
EACH West Music - Mortimer Book 202458 835229 $5.95 West Music
EACH Cat Goes Fiddle | Fee, by Paul Galdone 49679 834946 $6.84 West Music
EACH West Music - Make Mine Music DVD 202457 852649 $12.74 West Music
EACH Cup Drumming for Kids DVD 38938 853394 $12.74 West Music
EACH The Other Day | Met a Bear by John 34137 845665 $14.41 West Music
Feierabend
EACH The Frog and the Mouse by John Feierabend 34133 839406 $15.35 West Music
EACH My Aunt Came Back by John Feierabend 34134 830622 $15.35 West Music
EACH Father Grumble by John Feierabend 34135 834321 $15.35 West Music
EACH Ther's a Hole in the Bucket by John Feierabend | 34136 843758 $15.35 West Music
EACH West Music - The Remarkable Farkle McBride 202460 835318 $16.23 West Music
EACH West Music - The Nutcracker Book 202459 860189 $16.24 West Music
EACH Music in Motion: Book- Music Game of the 51452 550106 $19.63 West Music
Week
EACH The Best of Lomax the Hound DVD 49674 852761 $21.34 West Music
EACH Easy Ukulele Songs by Denise Gagne - 49673 860395 $25.50 West Music
Teachers' Edition
EACH Harmony Handbook, arr. Katie O'Connor- 55836 870390 $25.64 West Music

Ballantyne - Alfred Music Publishing Book &
Online PDF - 11105115

EACH West Music - Listen and Wiggle, Move and 202456 848350 $28.01 West Music
Giggle Book

EACH Music for Creative Movement 559100 853246 $29.88 West Music

EACH West Music - Holiday Songs and Winter 202455 870168 $29.91 West Music
Adventures

EACH Together (Eight Creative Titles for Unison 55906 867256 $30.00 West Music

Choir) - Mark Burrows, Heritage Music Press,
Unison Reproducible Book - 10846405

EACH GAMEPLAN Grade One Children's Literature - 55742 862163 $34.16 West Music
862163

EACH Recorder Resource Kit by Denise Gagne 49671 834331 $34.20 West Music

EACH GAMEPLAN Grade Two Children's Books - 55743 840247 $36.05 West Music

840247




EACH

Woods, Metals, Shakers, Skins: Hoop Group
Activities for Your Active Music Classroom by
Artie Almeida Paperback

51528

86978

$44.96

West Music

EACH

KidStix Curriculum Resource by Artie Almeida -
848368

26994

848368

$46.71

West Music

EACH

All American Partner Songs Book/Enhanced CD
pack by Sally K Albrecht - 10527335

55783

860083

$50.99

West Music

EACH

Folksong Partners Classroom kit by George
Strid Reproducible Book and CD - 10429104

55824

845672

$50.99

West Music

EACH

Patriotic Partners Classroom Kit by John
Jacobson Reproducible book and CD -
10149929

55867

837491

$51.29

West Music

EACH

Activate! Magazine

2023524

$0.00

EACH

Scales and Rhythm Chunks, Percussion - Focus
on Music

49696

$0.00

EACH

Accent on Achievement Book 1, by John
O'Reilly and Mark Williams, Alfred Music
Publishing - Flute book 1 - 5532528

55775

$0.00

EACH

Accent on Achievement Book 1 by John
O'Reilly and Mark Williams Alfred music
publishing Alto Sax book 1

55776

$0.00

EACH

Accent on Achievement Book 1 by John
O'Reilly and Mark Williams Alfred Music
Publishing Clarinet book 1

55777

$0.00

EACH

Accent on Achievement book 1 by John
O'Reilly and Mark Williams Alfred Music
Publishing trombone book 1 - 5532585

55778

$0.00

EACH

Accent on Achievement book 1 by John
O'Reilly and Mark Williams Alfred Music
Publishing Trumpet book 1 - 5532429

55779

$0.00

EACH

EACH

Accent on Achievement book one John O'Reilly
and Mark Williams Alfred Music Publishing
Percussion book 1 - 5532569

Bow - Bass - Full Size French, Brazilwood Stick,
Horsehair, Fully lined ebony frog, Parisian Style
Eye, Three Part Button, Nickel Wire Winding

55780

26620

BB5534F

$0.00

$125.00

Shar Products

EACH

Bow - Bass Size 3/4 Glasser Fiberglass French
Style with White Horsehair - G502R34F

23725

BBFGF3-4

$52.00

Baroque Violin Shop

SET

String Set - 1/2 Bass Helicore - 785512M

23731

SBHS1-2

$74.99

Baroque Violin Shop




15' Live Wire Advantage Series 1/4" Straight
Instrument Cable

Bugle - Amati ABG 203 26955 | 00

EACH

25' Live Wire Advantage Standard EXM Series
Microphone Cable - 25'

23843

$0.00

EACH

50 Ft. Pro Co Microphone Cable - SMM50

26609

$0.00

EACH

XLR 3P Male-Female Microphone Cable 10 ft

38968

$0.00

EACH

12' Monster Instrument Cable 1/4" Straight -
S-100

51490

$0.00

EACH

EACH

NANYI 1/4" Female to 1/8" Male Stereo
Headphone Adapter

Cello Outfit - 3/4 Size Shen SC-80, All Plywood
Construction, Maple Veneer Top, Painted
Purfling, Ebony Fingerboard, Ebony Pegs, CSC
Padded Bag and Eastman FG Bow with
Horsehair, Aubert Adjustable Bridge Must Be
Properly Fitted with Correct Radius, Graphite
Lubed String Grooves, Nut Adjusted for Ease of
Playing in the First Position, Ebony Fingerboard
Planed Adjusted Sanded for Proper Relief and
Edges Radius, Ebony Pegs Fitted, Wittner
Ultra-fine Tuner Tailpiece Installed, D'Addario
Prelude Strings, German Spruce Sound Post
Fitted, Final Adjustment for Conditions in
Upstate New York.

55861

23707

A200C3-4

$0.00

$645.00

Baroque Violin Shop Academy
200 3/4 Cello Outfit with Prelude
Strings, Padded Bag and Glasser
Fiberglass Bow

Baroque Violin Shop

EACH

Cello Outfit - 1/2 Size, Eastman - VC90

26416

A200C1-2

$645.00

Baroque Violin Shop Academy
200 1/2 Cello Outfit with Prelude
Strings, Padded Bag and Glasser
Fiberglass Bow

Baroque Violin Shop

EACH

Cello Outfit - 4/4 Size, Klaus Mueller Prelude
Full Size Cello, Laminated Spruce and Maple
Construction, Two Piece Back, Ebony pegs,
fingerboard and fittings. Four string adjusters
and four quality strings, Brazilwood horsehair
bow and cello bag - 225WF

26423

A200C4-4

$645.00

Baroque Violin Shop Academy
200 4/4 Cello Outfit with Prelude
Strings, Padded Bag and
Brazilwood Bow

EACH

Cello Rack, Holds Four Cellos, Cherry Finish

23858

$0.00

Baroque Violin Shop




EACH Bellafina Select Brazilwood Cello Bow 1/2 Size | 51521 KCB12 $20.95 | Schmidt Workshop Brazilwood Shar Products
Cello Bow 1/2 Size, Each

EACH Cello Bow - Size 4/4 - Glasser Fiberglass with 23710 F40244 $37.95 Shar Products
White Horsehair - F402R44

EACH Xeros Cello End pin anchor 51395 EPS-C $8.50 | Baroque Violin Shop Endpin Strap | Baroque Violin Shop

SET String Set - Cello - 4/4 Size Super Sensitive Red | 26418 SCSSS4-4 $33.00 Baroque Violin Shop
Label - 307ST-P

SET String Set - Cello - 3/4 Size Super Sensitive Red | 29576 SCSSS3-4 $33.00 Baroque Violin Shop
Label, Medium - 307S 34

PKG Vandoren, Mouthpiece Cushions, Black, Thick, 51393 Vandoren VMCX6 $9.99 Taylor Music Inc.
VMCX6, 6-pack - 098224

BOX Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength: 3 Rico - 10/Box 23746 Rico RCA1030 $14.99 Taylor Music Inc.

PKG Reeds - Clarinet - Strength 2-1/2 Rico Royal - 23750 Rico RCB1025 $14.99 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Pkg

PKG Reeds - Clarinet - Strength 3 Rico Royal - 23751 Rico RCB1030 $14.99 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Pkg

PKG Reeds - Bass Clarinet - Strength 2.5, Vandoren 23759 Vandoren CR1225 $19.88 Taylor Music Inc.
- 5/Pkg

EACH Ligatures and Caps - Bb Clarinet - Rovner Dark | 23744 Rovner 1R $19.90 Taylor Music Inc.

EACH Rovner Dark Bass Clarinet Ligature 55882 Rovner 3RL $19.90 Taylor Music Inc.

BOX Reeds - Bass Clarinet - Strength 3, Vandoren - 51503 Vandoren CR1225 $19.99 Taylor Music Inc.
5/Box

PKG Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 2.5, Vandoren - 23760 Vandoren CR1025 $21.49 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Pkg

PKG Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 3, Vandoren - 23761 Vandoren CR103 $21.49 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Pkg

BOX Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 3.5, Vandoren - 26954 Vandoren CR1035 $21.49 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Box

PKG Reeds - Bass Clarinet - Strength 2-1/2 Rico - 23753 Rico REA1025 $25.49 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Pkg

EACH Mouthpiece - Clarinet - Yamaha Plastic Bb - 26431 Yamaha CL4C $25.99 Taylor Music Inc.
YAC1266

EACH Mouthpiece - Clarinet - Clark W. Fobes Debut 23743 Fobes DEB-CL $26.99 Taylor Music Inc.

BOX Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength: 2-1/2 Rico - 23745 Rico RCA2525 $32.49 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Box




PKG Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 2-1/2 Rico - 23754 Rico RCA2525 $32.49 Taylor Music Inc.
25/Pkg
PKG Reeds - Bass Clarinet - Strength 2-1/2 Rico - 23748 Rico REA2525 $61.49 Taylor Music Inc.
25/Pkg
EACH Mouthpiece - Clarinet - Van Doren Bb - B45 26430 Vandoren CM308 $76.99 Taylor Music Inc.
B45
EACH Mouthpiece - Bass Clarinet - Vandoren - B45 23757 Vandoren CM344 $131.99 Taylor Music Inc.
(B45)
EACH Juno Bass Clarinet Reeds, Box of 25, strength 23779 $0.00
2.5
EACH Mouthpiece - Clarinet - Woodwind Bb Clarinet | 26969 $0.00
- 467211 000987000
SET Cushion - Clarinet - Yamaha for 26975 $0.00
Saxophone/Clarinet - .3 mm - 4/Set
EACH Cushion - Thum-Eez Clarinet Thumb Rest 26976 $0.00
EACH Ligature - Metal Tradition Clarinet 26977 $0.00
EACH Clarinet Loop Neck Strap - 10606331 35724 $0.00
EACH Legere Bass Clarinet Reed - LEBCLXXXX 35727 $0.00
EACH Clarinet Swabs 51387 $0.00
BOX Reeds - Alto Clarinet - Strength 2.0, Rico - 51495 $0.00
25/Box
BOX Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 2.0, Juno - 51505 $0.00
25/Box
BOX Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 2.5, Juno - 51506 $0.00
25/Box
EACH Giardinelli Clarinet Handkerchief Cleaning 55825 $0.00
Swab
EACH Protec PB319, Bass Clarinet Case - 087533 51463 $169.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH Clarinet - Buffet E-flat Clarinet E-11 - BC2501N- | 23669 $889.97 Alamo Music Center
5-0
EACH Bass Clarinet - Yamaha Intermediate - YCL221ll | 27726 $1,899.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH Clarinet - Yamaha YCL255 23670 2538403 $399.00 | F.E. OLDS NCL112PC The Music Wagon
EACH Buffet Crampon Premium Student B-flat 51455 2538403 $399.00 | F.E. OLDS NCL112PC The Music Wagon
Clarinet - J39021
EACH Bass Clarinet - Yamaha Student w/ Low Eb - 27733 2538403 $1,599.00 | F.E. OLDS NO541 The Music Wagon
YCL-221lI
EACH Clarinet - Yamaha YCL255 23670 Yamaha YCL-255 $399.00 | (Per factory availability) Taylor Music Inc.
EACH Konga - Kids Remo Rainforest - 6 X 15 26484 200590 $39.34 West Music




EACH Djembe - Kids Remo Rainforest - 8 X 14" - 26485 200678 $87.17 West Music
KD060801

EACH Tubano - Kids Remo Rainforest - 10 X 22" - 26488 201578 $103.33 West Music
KD001001

SET Tubano - Remo 100 Series Tunable - 3/Set - 26520 203574 $670.68 West Music
TU1110,TU1112,TU1114

EACH Dulcimer Strings, Nickel Alloy, Standard - M640 | 49724 _ $0.00 _

EACH Flute - Gemeinhardt - 2SP 23677 $262.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH BO Pep Flute Saddle, Woodwind Brasswind Co. | 49711 BoPEP3 $9.95 Taylor Music Inc.

- 460143000000000
EACH Flute - Yamaha YFL221 23676 Yamaha YFL-222 $383.00 | (Per factory availability) Taylor Music Inc.

EACH Blessing BFH-1287 Standard Series Single F 51453 2538403 $738.00 The Music Wagon
French Horn

EACH French Horn - Holton Single F - H602 26438 2538403 $984.00 | F.E. OLDS FH560 The Music Wagon

EACH French Horn - Conn 6D Double 26434 2538403 $1,680.00 | F.E. OLDS FH580 The Music Wagon

EACH French Horn - Yamaha YHR567 26439 2538403 $1,985.00 | BLESSING 1461N The Music Wagon

EACH ORFF Table Stand, Basic Beat BBRTTS 26990 259587 $137.27 West Music

West Music

Combination

EACH Instrument Cart with Wheels, Holds 30 49703 356309 $733.27
Ukuleles, Music Is Elementary - BRUS30
EACH Wenger String Bass Rack - Oyster Color 55917 $0.00

28156

EACH Poster | Want You to Practice 3362 28428 MIM# 3362 $2.25 Music In Motion

PKG Brass Pencil, Black with Shiny, Gold 55797 MIM# 1410 $4.00 Music In Motion
Instruments - 12/Pkg

PKG | (Heart) Band Pencils - 12/Pkg 55838 MIM# 1555 $4.00 Music In Motion

PKG Percussion Pencil, Black with shiny, copper 55872 MIM# 1478 $4.00 Music In Motion
Instruments - 12/Pkg

PKG Woodwind Pencil, Black with Shiny, Silver 55926 MIM# 1442 $4.00 Music In Motion
Instruments - 12/Pkg

EACH Music Staff Wall Decal 3223 28426 MIM# 3223 $15.95 Music In Motion

EACH Music-Go-Round, Mini - Alphadots - Set 2 - 55751 MIM# 28156 $18.00 Music In Motion




EACH Music-Go-Round, Mini - Theory in All Keys - 55858 MIM# 28153 $18.00 Music In Motion

28153

EACH Music Literacy Solfege Bingo Level 1 - SO-MI- 35713 MIM# 6108 $19.99 Music In Motion
LA - 10150124

EACH Rhythm Instruments, Picture Disksm Music- 55859 MIM# 28113 $22.00 Music In Motion

Go-Rounds silicone manipulatives Rhythm
Instruments - 16/Set

EACH Write on dots, Music-Go-Rounds 55860 MIM# 28032 $28.00 Music In Motion
Manipulatives, Assorted Colors, - 36/Set

EACH Music-Go-Round, Mini - Rhythms Simple Time | 55750 MIM# 99266 $32.00 Music In Motion
& Add-Ons Set - 99266

EACH Jukebox Time Machine (A Presentation of Hits | 55845 MIM# 21670 $69.99 Music In Motion

Through the Decades) by Andy Beck and Brian
Fisher - Alfred Music Publishing Reproducible
Book & Enhanced CD - 10631925

EACH Musical Scarves & Activities CD- G. Stewart 51443 850439 $13.64 West Music

EACH Ribbons and Rhythms CD - M. Plunkett 51532 853129 $13.64 West Music

EACH Hal Leonard Melody Flashcard Kit 51411 530186 $20.30 West Music

PKG Instruments of the Symphony Orchestra Poster | 55842 530615 $21.25 West Music
Pack - 530615

EACH Exploring Musical Skill, Folk Songs and Folk 55820 853103 $21.33 West Music

Instruments (Bass Hall Children's Concert) - Jill
Trinka, GIA Publications, DVD with Guide -

10308827

EACH Music Centers Reproducible Kit #1 by Veronica | 10295727 550135 $21.37 West Music
Harper - 10295727

SET Elemental Music Making by Don DuPont and 55851 864314 $23.05 West Music

Brian Hiller, Book and CD, Published by
Heritage Music Press - 9780787757267
EACH The Vocalize! Canon Collection, Andy Beck - 55904 866507 $29.91 West Music
Alfred Music Publishing, Unison/Two-Part
Book & Enhanced CD Reproducible with
enhanced CD- 10802223

EACH Conducting Baton King David 28B 38954 $0.00 NO Bid

EACH 8 Note Glockenspiel - 1545 49669 1545 $19.95 Music In Motion

EACH Soprano Glockenspiels w/removable bars, 26528 201806 $193.80 West Music
tuned to A440 2 mallets included

EACH Adams 3.3 Octave Concert Series Glockenspiel | 202417 Adams GCA33 (no $3,577.00 | (Per factory availability) Taylor Music Inc.

pedal)




SET D'Addario Phosphor Bronze Acoustic guitar 51403 EJ16 $4.97 | Price per each set Shar Products
strings - EJ16-3D

SET D'Addario Pro-Arte Nylon Classical guitar 51400 EJ45 $7.17 Shar Products
strings-normal tension - EJ45

SET String Set - Classical Normal Tension, 23817 355051 $5.53 West Music
D'Addario EJ27N

SET D'Addario EXL 115 Medium Gauge Guitar 38983 354774 $13.22 West Music
Strings 3 pack

EACH Acoustic Guitar - 3/4 Size Yamaha JR1 26998 300930 $117.56 West Music

EACH Acoustic Guitar - Classical Yamaha C40 Natural | 23814 303442 $129.19 West Music

EACH Acoustic Guitar - 3/4 Size Classical Yamaha CGS | 23813 $109.97 Alamo Music Center

EACH Yamaha TRBX174EW Mango Wood 4 String 38975 TRBX174EW TBL $249.97 Alamo Music Center
Electric Bass

EACH Gig Bag - Musician's Gear Classical 23815 $0.00

SET String Set - Acoustic Guitar - Martin 80/20 23816 $0.00
Bronze Wound Extra Light

DOZ Guitar Picks - Medium Fender - Dozen 23819 $0.00

EACH Guitar Capo - Dunlop Trigger Classical - 361511 | 26974 $0.00
001 Model #88B

EACH Earthwood medium light guitar strings 2003 28439 $0.00

EACH String swing home&studio guitar keeper wall 28441 $0.00
hanger 713104

EACH D'Addario EXL160BT Nickel Bass Guitar 49690 $0.00
Strings, 50-120 DEXL160BT-P

EACH Regular Slinky Electric Guitar Strings, 3-Pack, 49691 $0.00

Ernie Ball - E32221XXX-P

SET Music-Go-Rounds Rhythm N'Counters - 28054 | 35723 28054 $49.00 Music In Motion
EACH Casio Casiotone CT-S300 Portable Keyboard 55805 101164 $154.99 West Music
with AC wall adapter
EACH Power Adapter for Casio AD-E95100 9.5V AC 23784 $34.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH Casio ADA12150 Keyboard adapter 55804 $39.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH Roland DP-10 Piano Sustain Pedal - DP-10 51469 $49.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH Keyboard - Casio SA-76 with the Adapter 26450 $69.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH Grand Piano Yamaha 2023525 $45,997.97 | KAWAI GX-3BLK EP: 6FT 2IN Alamo Music Center
EBONY POLISH




PAIR Mallets - ORFF Medium Yarn 26997 261016 $11.30
Xylophone/Metallophone - Basic Beat BBYM
EACH Ludwig Payson Concert Bass Drum Mallet L- 202484 $0.00
308 Payson Sostenuto, Woodwind Brasswind
co.
EACH Ludwig M-336 Chime Mallet 202485 $0.00
SET Mallets - Yarn Covered 23822 $0.00
SET Mallets - Bell Vic Firth 23823 $0.00
SET Mallets - Xylophone Rubber - 2/Set 23824 $0.00
SET Mallets - Vibe Vic Firth Medium - M186 23828 $0.00
SET Mallets - Vibe Vic Firth Hard - M187 23829 $0.00
SET Mallets - Timpani Vic Firth Vic - T3 23830 $0.00
EACH Goodwood 12-Pack Drum Sticks 5B Nylon 289501 $0.00
EACH Sonor SCH30 Single Mallet 34184 $0.00
SET Mallets - Vic Firth - M182 38955 $0.00
EACH Vater Staccato Timpani Mallets - T2 51479
Vater General Timpani Mallets - T3 51480

Vater Legato Timpani Mallets - T4

Blue Microphones Yeti Studio USB Condenser
Microphone

51481

Hosa GPM-103 Headphone adapter

West Music

EACH Music in Motion, Music Case Tags 1041000 1114 $1.50 Music In Motion
EACH 2" Filing Box, Choral 958256 29004 $2.50 Music In Motion
EACH Music Filing Boxes, instrumental size, Model 958355 29007 $2.50 | Concert Band/Orchestra 9.5 x Music In Motion
60-3,11/2" deep - 958355 12.75 x 1.5 Musi-File Box
SET Gold Note Pencils, Pkg/12 , 1658 202418 1658 $4.50 Music In Motion
PKG Magical Music Pencils, Pkg/12 , 1775 202424 1775 $4.50 Music In Motion
PKG Music Certificates - 25/pkg - 23516 35783 23516 $6.50 Music In Motion
EACH Music in Motion, Bulletin Board Kit, Add-On 1041002 4410 $15.00 | Music Symbols Bulletin Board Set | Music In Motion
Symbols
SET Rhythm Band Lummi Sticks - set of 24 38962 26154 $34.95 | Colorful Lummi sticks set of 12 Music In Motion
pair; smooth hardwood; 7inches;
made in USA
BOX "I love Chorus" Music Pencils - 144/Box - 4826 | 51515 4826 $45.00 Music In Motion




SET Rhythm Band 12 colored scarves 23827 3077 $48.00 | 25 inch Rainbow scarves; set of Music In Motion
12
EACH Mi-T-Mist - 2 Oz. 23845 450185 $3.22 West Music
EACH Sterisol Germicide Concentrate - 8 oz 34117 451428 $6.38 West Music
EACH Mi-T-Mist Mouthpiece Cleaner Disinfectant, 32 | 35725 452039 $13.72 West Music
oz. 1003-RT125
EACH West Music - Bobcat Mouthpiece Puller 202427 450449 $46.49 West Music
EACH Shure Microphone w/Clip - SM57 26610 630148 $84.65 West Music
EACH Shure Dynamic Vocal Mic SM58LC 34154 630149 $84.65 West Music
SET Dry Erase Board Student Staff Template 51459 530188 $195.48 West Music
(classroom set) w/ Markers - 30/Set
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Alto Sax) 202419 $0.00
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Bass Clarinet) 202420 $0.00
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Clarinet) 202421 $0.00
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Flute) 202422 $0.00
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Tenor Sax) 202423 $0.00
EACH Premier Music Teaching Aids LLC - 9-Piece 202425 $0.00
Woodwind and Brass Combo Set Self-inking
Rubber Stamps, RS-WBCOMBO
EACH Vendor: Premier Music Teaching Aids LLC - 202426 $0.00
Mallet Percussion Self-inking Rubber Stamp,
RS-MALLET
EACH Triangle Beaters Dammar 23825 $0.00
EACH Selmer Slide Grease - 2942 23832 $0.00
EACH Valentino Spring Hook Tool 23834 $0.00
EACH Adhesive Back Cork Sheet 1/16 23837 $0.00
EACH Adhesive Back Cork Sheet 1/32 23838 $0.00
EACH Adhesive Back Cork Sheet 1/64 23839 $0.00
EACH Adhesive Back Cork Sheet 3/64 23840 $0.00
KIT Herco Mini Repair Kit 23841 $0.00
EACH IK Multimedia iRig - Audio Interface Adapter 26948 $0.00
for iPhone, iPod, iPad
EACH 3" Gaffer's Stage Tape - 60 Yd Roll Black 26949 $0.00
EACH Cork Grease - 15 Oz Tube 26970 $0.00
EACH Mouthpiece Shank Repair Tool - A04tt995 38952 $0.00
EACH 2" Filing Box - GIA Publication GB2 49702 $0.00
EACH Ferree's H70 Quick-Dry Cork Cement - RP910 51406 $0.00
EACH Fingerboard Tape, 40' Roll - FT6BLR - Blue 55752 $0.00
EACH Fingerboard Tape, 40' Roll - FT6WR - White 55754 $0.00
EACH Fingerboard Tape, 40' Roll - FT6YR - Yellow 55755 $0.00




EACH Audio 2000's AMC418 wireless microphone 55786 $0.00
holder
EACH Shure SM58S corded vocal mic with switch 55787 $0.00
EACH Deer River Grand Concert No 90" Black Band 2023531 $0.00
Folder with window
EACH Black Model 3501 Instrumental Folder, Raised- | 202486 $0.00
Grain Leatherette, Deer River Folio, Inc.
EACH JW Pepper, The Black Folder Choir RingBinder 202487 $0.00
Music Folder 3-Ring Binder with 2 Expanding
Pockets
EACH 9 X 12 Humes & Berg F3100BLK Black Choral 23846 $0.00
Folders
EACH 12 X 14 Humes & Berg Band Folio w/ 27735 $0.00
Expanding Pocket - F7100
EACH 9 X 12 Deer River Folio Model 801 Choral 35711 $0.00
Folder - Black 1309475
EACH Basic Choral Folders, 3 Ring Binder 35716 $0.00
EACH 12 X 14 Deer River Concert Band Folio with 49698 $0.00
Expanding Pocket - DS046
EACH 9-1/2 X 12-1/2 Folio Model 101 Choral Folder, | 49722 $0.00
Black w/ White Notes - 1817691
EACH Concert Band Folders, Cascio Music K452 $0.00
EACH Rhythm Band Instruments Boomwhacker 26004 MIM# 4213 $16.95 Music In Motion
Stand
EACH Music Stands - Manhasset - AC 48 26611 500171 $43.66 West Music
EACH Cart - Music Stands - Manhasset Model #1910 | 26951 500144 $417.45 West Music
Storage Cart
EACH Oboe - Selmer USA Grenadilla Wood - 122F 26461 $2,429.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH Jones Oboe Reed Medium - WWBW - 462688 35714 Jones Med Oboe $12.66 Taylor Music Inc.
000118000
EACH Oboe - Fox 330 26459 Fox 330 $3,469.00 | (Per factory availability) Taylor Music Inc.
EACH Eastman, Oboe Reed - Medium/Soft - 074535 51388 $0.00
EACH Eastman, Oboe Reed - Medium - 074536 51389 $0.00
Emerald Plastic Oboe Reed, Medium $0.00




EACH Dark Wood Block Rosin - Violin/Cello - Shar 26932 1196D $1.45 Shar Products
1196D

EACH Carlsson Bass Rosin 1049100 CSR $8.95 Shar Products

EACH Kolstein Ultra Bass Rosin - All Weather SK3 U 28437 SK3UAW $9.95 Shar Products
AW

EACH Super Sensitive Violin Rosin #912 38964 RSSDVN $3.50 Baroque Violin Shop

EACH Valve Oil - 1.25 Fl oz. 23835 $0.00

EACH Blue Juice Valve Qil - 8 oz 23836 $0.00

EACH Trombone Slide Lubricant, Slide-O-Mix 019443 | 51392

Holton Valve Oil 1.6 oz - 12/Pkg 51471

Sonor Primary SMP 1-1 Soprano Metallophone 203779 $353.40

- 829193360834
EACH Orff Instrumentarium Exploration Mallet Kit - 51466 $0.00
P2525

SET Rhythm Sticks - 2/Set 212298 2480 $4.95 Music In Motion

EACH Maracas - 9-1/2" Large Plastic - RB1208 26501 4916 $5.95 | Music in Motion 8.5 inch x 3 inch | Music In Motion
plastic maracas

SET Rhythm Band Claves Select Hardwood 34165 4518 $6.95 Music In Motion

EACH Boomwhackers BWCAPS Octavator Tube Cap 26007 4208 $12.95 Music In Motion

EACH West Music - Remo Fiberskyn 10 Inch 202411 4591 $16.95 | Music in Motion tambourine 10" | Music In Motion
Tambourine with head; double jingle

EACH American Song 302 Slide Whistle 49666 2856 $36.95 Music In Motion

EACH Union Sleigh Bells PC1065SB25 28442 26043 $45.00 | Music in Motion sleigh bells 25 Music In Motion

bells solid handled stick 14 inch

SET Chroma Notes Handbells 5 Note Chromatic 55807 2919 $48.95 Music In Motion
Add-On
SET Hand Bell Set - 8 Note Deluxe - 33121 26474 3009 $69.00 | Chroma Notes 8 note set w/ case | Music In Motion

[also avail without case]

EACH Basic Beat BB201 Egg Shaker 26006 202376 $1.57 West Music

EACH Triangle - 4" Steel Triangle with Striker and 26978 203767 $4.00 West Music
Holder - WMHO07

EACH West Music - Small Basic Beat Plastic Maracas 202413 204139 $4.44 West Music

EACH Woodblock with Mallet - Basic Beat BBHHO5 26979 203765 $4.80 West Music




EACH Cowbell, Westco BE7202 55922 204379 $7.23 West Music

EACH 14" Fish Shaped Guiro with Striker, Basic Beat 55919 200901 $12.08 West Music
BBG14

EACH Boomwhackers BWCG 5-Note Chromatics Set 26008 200348 $12.97 West Music

SET Pentatonic Boomwacker Set - MP-BW210 35784 200341 $14.50 West Music

EACH West Music - 6 Inch Brass Cymbals 202409 205134 $15.10 West Music

EACH G-780B Togo Seed Rattle 26001 202327 $15.11 West Music

EACH Woodstock Zenergy Chime Trio 3638 49881 202180 $17.57 West Music

SET Boomwhackers 8-note C Major Diatonic Set - 26993 200346 $18.68 West Music
BWDG

EACH American Plating Slide Whistle - 302W 51488 400464 $19.94 West Music

SET Sonor Sch 23 Wool Felt Mallets, Hard - West 49708 261227 $22.80 West Music
Music 261227

EACH Zildjian Thick finger Cymbals ZP0771-P 49689 200624 $24.51 West Music

EACH Latin Percussion LP389 Fiber Maracas - L389-P 49682 200999 $30.68 West Music

EACH West Music - Set of 8, 10 and 12 Inch Frame 202412 205534 $43.69 West Music
Drum

EACH West Music - Bear Paw Creek Band 18 Feet 202410 540029 $46.27 West Music

EACH Pearl Snare Drum Stand - S930 55871 261875 $75.50 West Music

EACH Bell Tree - LP Handheld with Striker - LP589 26478 213402 $177.64 West Music

EACH Covers - Timpani Drop Covers, 26" Short - 26469 $43.97 Alamo Music Center
Yamaha TDC-26S

EACH Covers - Timpani Drop Covers, 29" Short - 26471 $45.97 Alamo Music Center
Yamaha TDC-29S

EACH 14" Zildjian ZBT Crash Cymbal - 444590 51468 S$14TC $103.97 Alamo Music Center

EACH 16" Zildjian ZBT Series Crash Cymbal - 51462 $111.97 Alamo Music Center
ZZBT16CXX ILH16C

EACH Cymbals - 14 Inch Hi Hat, Sabian 41402X 37507 $174.99 Alamo Music Center

EACH Pearl MX T-Frame, Bass Drum Carrier, Steve 49706 $196.97 Alamo Music Center
Weiss Music - PEA-MXB-1

EACH Snare Drum Stand Pearl S-1030LS 38949 $209.97 Alamo Music Center

EACH Percussion Bell Kit - lightweight aluminum 26517 $266.97 Alamo Music Center
Starts on F, X-Style Bell Stand, Music Stand,
Student Percussion Mallets, and Practice Snare
Pad - Yamaha SPK 285

EACH Bell Kit - Student Bell Kit includes a lightweight | 26963 $283.97 Alamo Music Center

aluminum Bells, Starts on F, X-style Bell Stand,
Music Stand, Student Percussion Mallets,
Practice Snare Pad with Rolling Cart - Yamaha
SPK-285R




EACH 14" X 6.5" Pearl Concert Series Snare Drum, 55910 $611.97 Alamo Music Center
Natural Maple Finish CRP1465
SET Timpani - 23, 26, 29 and 32" Set - Ludwig 26498 $8,959.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH Adams 1.5 Octave Standard 1.25" Chimes 55925 Adams BK2201C $3,777.00 | (Per factory availability) Taylor Music Inc.
EACH Stand - Snare Drum, Double Brace - Ludwig 26482 $0.00
LM921SS
SET Bell Set - 5 Large Sleigh Bells Mounted Handle | 26504 $0.00
Grip - RB805
EACH Slide Whistle - SW-200 26526 $0.00
EACH Stand - Cymbal - Yamaha Heavy Duty 26536 $0.00
EACH Bells - Agogo Bells with Mallets - RB702 26953 $0.00
EACH Guiro - CP Fish Style, Wood 27730 $0.00
EACH Toca Percussion Ratchet T2525 Ratchet 35721 $0.00
SET Zildjian Wood Drum Sticks 38950 $0.00
EACH Yamaha SS-3 Snare Stand, Lightweight 55928 $0.00

Aluminum, Height Adjustable, Locking
Mechanism, 3 Foldable Legs - YSS3XXXXX

Piccolo - Silver Plated with 3 yr. warranty -
NL78G

EACH Essential Elements with EEi, Book 1, 202465 7062 467 $8.15 Shar Products
00868052. String Bass, Southwest Strings
868052

EACH Essential Elements BK1 Viola - 5971380 55815 7062 267 $8.15 Shar Products

EACH Essential Elements Cello BK1 - 5971381 55816 7062 367 $8.15 Shar Products

EACH Essential Elements Violin BK1, Michael Allen, 55818 7062 167 $8.15 Shar Products
Robert Gillespie & Pamela Tellejohn Hayes -
Hal Leonard Corporation - 5971379

EACH Let's Sing! Two-Part Reproducible Book 202466 870518 $42.46 West Music
Volume 1

EACH Let's Sing! Two-Part Reproducible Book 202467 870519 $42.46 West Music
Volume 2

EACH All for Strings: Primo Performance , K90VN, 202461 $0.00
Southwest Strings Company K90VN

EACH Standard of Excellence Book 1 - Baritone BC 202469 $0.00

EACH Standard of Excellence Book 1 - Oboe 202470 $0.00

EACH Breeze Easy Band Method (Warner Bros) Flute | 27007 $0.00

Book 1




EACH Breeze Easy Band Method (Warner Bros) 27009 $0.00
Clarinet Book 1

EACH Breeze Easy Band Method (Warner Bros) 27010 $0.00
Saxophone Book 1

EACH Breeze Easy Band Method (Warner Bros) 27011 $0.00
Trumpet Book 1

EACH Breeze Easy Band Method (Warner Bros) 27015 $0.00
Drums Book 1

EACH Alfred Sound Innovations for Concert Band 27027 $0.00
Clarinet Book 1

EACH Alfred Sound Innovations for Concert Band 27028 $0.00
Alto Saxophone Book 1

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 1 | 28117 $0.00
- RED - Flute

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 1 | 28118 $0.00
- RED - Clarinet

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 1 | 28119 $0.00
- RED - Alto Saxophone

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 1 | 28120 $0.00
- RED - Trumpet

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 1 | 28121 $0.00
- RED - Trombone

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 1 | 28123 $0.00
- RED - Percussion

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 1 | 28124 $0.00
- RED - Oboe

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 2 | 28136 $0.00
- BLUE - Trombone

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 2 | 28137 $0.00
- BLUE - Baritone Bass Clef

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 2 | 28139 $0.00
- BLUE - Oboe

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 2 | 28143 $0.00
- BLUE - Tenor Saxophone

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 2 | 28145 $0.00
- BLUE - French Horn

EACH Traditions of Excellence Band Method - Book 2 | 28146 $0.00
- BLUE - Tuba

EACH Standard of Excellence BK1 Alto Sax - 5185988 | 55892 $0.00




Book Pack 900283

EACH Standard of Excellence BK1 clarinet, Bruce 55893 $0.00
Pearson - Neil A. Kjos Music Company -
5185921

EACH Standard of Excellence Book 1 - Flute, 55894 $0.00
Composed by Bruce Pearson - 5185939

EACH Standard of Excellence BK1 Trombone, Bruce 55895 $0.00
Pearson - Neil A. Kjos Music Company -
5186036

EACH Standard Of Excellence Bkl Trumpet - 5186010 | 55896 $0.00

EACH Hal Leonard Electric Bass Method Composite 900283 $0.00

order is placed. Blue or black recorders with
zip case

EACH Recorder - Soprano Angel One Piece 27731 400215 $2.39 West Music
EACH Recorder - Soprano Yamaha YRS-24B (3 pc) 23821 400295 $4.24 West Music
EACH Recorder - Soprano Yamaha, Plastic - YRS-23 26606 400294 $4.24 West Music
EACH Recorder - Soprano 3 Sections - SRE-3 26607 $0.00
EACH Macie Publishing, 5 Recorders when recorder K668 $0.00

Neck Pad and Plastic Swivel Snap, 24-in.
Length

EACH Soprano Saxophone - Yamaha B Flat YSS475 26395 $1,919.97 Alamo Music Center
EACH Tenor Saxophone - Yamaha YTS26 26397 2538403 $989.00 | F.E. OLDS NA66MNII The Music Wagon
EACH Baritone Saxophone - Yamaha YBS52 with Case | 26396 2538403 $3,305.00 | F.E.OLDS NBS115 The Music Wagon
EACH Alto Saxophone - Yamaha YAS26 26394 Yamaha YAS-26 $949.00 | (Per factory availability) Taylor Music Inc.
EACH Alto Saxophone Cleaning Swab 202414 $0.00

EACH Protec Saxophone Neck Strap with Velour 202415 $0.00

Padded Saxophone Neck Strap

$0.00

Cap 2R

EACH Yamaha YAC1607 Alto Saxophone Ligature 202480 Yamaha YAC 1607 $5.11 Taylor Music Inc.

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Tenor, Vandoren - Strength | 26551 Vandoren SR2225 $18.99 Taylor Music Inc.
2-1/2 - 5/Pkg

BOX Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Rico Strength 3 - 26540 Rico RJA1030 $19.49 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Box

EACH Rovner Dark Baritone Saxophone Ligature 55881 Rovner $19.90 Taylor Music Inc.

EACH Rovner Dark Tenor Saxophone Ligature and 55883 Rovner 2R $19.90 Taylor Music Inc.




EACH Mouthpiece - Saxophone Alto, Yamaha Plastic 26552 Yamaha YAC-AS5C $23.77 Taylor Music Inc.
- YAC1286 (1286)

EACH Yamaha 4C Tenor Saxophone Mouthpiece 10182 Yamaha YAC TS4C $24.99 Taylor Music Inc.

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Vandoren - Strength 26547 Vandoren SR2125 $25.99 Taylor Music Inc.
2-1/2 - 10/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Vandoren - Strength 3 | 26548 Vandoren SR213 $25.99 Taylor Music Inc.
- 10/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Tenor, Rico - Strength 3 - 26543 Rico RKA1030 $26.29 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Baritone, Rico Strength 3- | 26968 Rico RLA1030 $32.49 Taylor Music Inc.
10/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Baritone, Vandoren - 26550 Vandoren SR2425 $32.99 Taylor Music Inc.
Strength 2-1/2 - 5/Pkg

EACH Yamaha 5C Baritone Saxophone Mouthpiece 10183 Yamaha BS5C $36.99 Taylor Music Inc.

PKG Rico Reeds - Alto Saxophone Strength: 3 - 23766 Rico RJA2530 $42.99 Taylor Music Inc.
25/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Rico Strength 2-1/2 - 26545 Rico RJA2525 $42.99 Taylor Music Inc.
25/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Rico Royal Strength 2- | 26541 Rico RIB0125-B25 $45.49 Taylor Music Inc.
1/2 - 25/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Tenor, Rico Royal Strength | 26542 Rico RKBO1250B25 $60.49 Taylor Music Inc.
2-1/2 - 25/Pkg

BOX Reeds - Tenor Saxophone - Strength 2, Rico 51509 Rico RKA2520 $60.99 Taylor Music Inc.
Orange Box - 25/Box

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Baritone, Rico Strength 2.5 | 23770 Rico RJA2525 $76.99 Taylor Music Inc.
- 25/Pkg

BOX Vandoren JAVA Red Alto Saxophone Reeds 202479 $0.00 NO Bid
Strength 2, Box of 10

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Vandoren V16 - 23774 $0.00 NO Bid
Strength 2.5 - 10/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Vandoren V16 - 23775 $0.00 NO Bid
Strength 3 - 10/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Tenor Vandoren V16 - 23776 $0.00 NO Bid
Strength 2.5 - 5/Pkg

PKG Saxophone Reeds - Tenor Vandoren V16 - 23777 $0.00 NO Bid
Strength 3 - 5/Pkg

EACH Strap - Saxophone Neotech Soft, Regular, 26941 $0.00 NO Bid
Swivel Hook - Black

EACH Legere Synthetic Studio Cut Alto Sax Reed - 35726 $0.00 NO Bid

LEASSC35X-P




EACH Legere Synthetic Studio Cut Tenor Saxophone 35729 $0.00
Reed - LETSSC3XX

EACH Rico Royal Tenor Saxophone Mouthpiece 38958 $0.00
Tambe B

EACH APM Tenor Saxophone Ligature 38959 $0.00

EACH APM Baritone Saxophone Ligature 38960 $0.00

EACH Alto Saxophone Standard Ligature, Woodwind | 49710 $0.00
and Brasswind - 465097000906000

BOX Reeds - Alto Saxophone - Strength 2.0, Juno - 51498 $0.00
25/Box

BOX Reeds - Alto Saxophone - Strength 2.5, Juno - 51499 $0.00
25/Box

BOX Reeds - Alto Saxophone - Strength 3.0, Juno - 51500 $0.00
25/Box

BOX Juno Tenor Saxophone Reeds, strength 2.5 - 55846 $0.00
25/Box

EACH 6 Note Parade by Joseph Compello band set 2023522 $0.00
and score

EACH 6 Note Root Beer Float by Joseph Compello 2023523 $0.00

EACH Bonse Aba 3 Part Mixed Victor Johnson 51413 $0.00

EACH Calico Cat, Andy Beck - Alfred Music 55802 $0.00
Publishing, Two-Part - 10996689

EACH Easy Bucket Drumming - Peavoy 55811 $0.00

EACH | Ku Mau Mau, Ruth Morris Gray - Alfred Music | 55839 $0.00
Publishing, two Part - 10997457

SET Dorchester Street Songs for String Orchestra - | 55843 $0.00
2382414

SET Great Themes from TV and Movies for String 55848 $0.00
Orchestra, arr. Bob Cerulli Alfred Publishing
Belwin Division E-Edition - 10083125E

SET Two African Folk Songs band set and score by 55849 $0.00
J. Bullock, published by Alfred - 029156993721

SET "To the Fore" by Chris M. Bernotas, Band Set 55850 $0.00
Amp; score, Alfred Publishing - 038081481739

SET Variations on a Sea Shanty band set and score | 55852 $0.00
arr. Robert Sheldon, published by Alfred Music
-10453092

EACH Pirulito, arr. Mark Burrows - Shawnee Press, 55874 $0.00

Two-Part - 10995733




EACH

EACH

Singable Solutions for Winter Holidays, Mary
Lynn Lightfoot - Heritage Music Press, Two
Part Choral Score- 8067072

String Bass Outfit - Size 3/4 Shen, All plywood,
maple veneer top, ebony fingerboard, painted
purfling with padded bag and FG French bow,
41-1/4" string length, Bridge must be properly
fitted with correct radius, String grooves
lubricated with graphite, Nut cut and shaped
with string height set for ease of playing in the
first position, Ebony fingerboard planed
adjusted sanded for proper relief and edges
radius, Brass machines oiled and checked for
smooth operation, DAddario Helicore Hybrid
Medium Strings, Post fitted and adjusted for
sound, final adjustment for conditions in
upstate New York - SB80

55885

23721

A200B3-4

$0.00

$1,200.00

Baroque Violin Shop Academy
200 3/4 Bass Outfit with Helicore
Strings, Padded Bag and Glasser
Fiberglass Bow

Baroque Violin Shop

EACH

String Bass Outfit - Size 1/2 Shen, All plywood,
maple veneer top, ebony fingerboard, painted
purfling with padded bag and FG French bow,
41-1/4" string length, Bridge must be properly
fitted with correct radius, String grooves
lubricated with graphite, Nut cut and shaped
with string height set for ease of playing in the
first position, Ebony fingerboard planed
adjusted sanded for proper relief and edges
radius, Brass machines oiled and checked for
smooth operation, D'Addario Helicore Hybrid
Medium Strings, Post fitted and adjusted for
sound, final adjustment for conditions in
upstate New York.

23722

A200B1-2

$1,200.00

Baroque Violin Shop Academy
200 1/2 Bass Outfit with Helicore
Strings, Padded Bag and Glasser
Fiberglass Bow

Baroque Violin Shop




EACH

EACH

String Bass Outfit - Size 1/4 Shen, All plywood,
maple veneer top, ebony fingerboard, painted
purfling with padded bag and FG French bow,
41-1/4" string length, Bridge must be properly
fitted with correct radius, String grooves
lubricated with graphite, Nut cut and shaped
with string height set for ease of playing in the
first position, Ebony fingerboard planed
adjusted sanded for proper relief and edges
radius, Brass machines oiled and checked for
smooth operation, D'Addario Helicore Hybrid
Medium Strings, Post fitted and adjusted for
sound, final adjustment for conditions in
upstate New York.

Keyboard - Yamaha PSRE343KIT (With Power
Supply)

23723

23785

A200B1-4

$1,200.00

$0.00

Baroque Violin Shop Academy
200 1/4 Bass Outfit with Helicore
Strings, Padded Bag and Glasser
Fiberglass Bow

Baroque Violin Shop

EACH

Clavimover - Piano Dolly for a Yamaha YDP 18

26451

$0.00

EACH

Digital Piano - Stage, Yamaha P80

26454

$0.00

EACH

Digital Piano - Portable Yamaha Black -
DGX650B w/ Power Supply

26964

$0.00

EACH

Stand - Keyboard - On Stage X-Style

26983

$0.00

EACH

EACH

Clavimover - Piano Dolly Vanda-King's Piano
Showcase Product: Jansen Grand Piano with
Locking Wheels

Trombone Mouthpiece 7C

51525

26563

$0.00

$0.00

EACH

EACH

Bach 6-1/2 AL Silver Trombone Mouthpieces
#44391 - Small Shank

Trombone - Prelude, Conn Selmer TB711

26619

26562

$0.00

$419.97

Alamo Music Center

EACH

Yamaha Trombone - YSL354

23675

2538403

$425.00

F.E. OLDS NTB110PC

The Music Wagon

Trombone - Bach Student Bb - TB301

Mouthpiece - Trumpet, Bach 5C Silver - 3515C

2538403

$425.00

F.E. OLDS NTB110PC

The Music Wagon

EACH

Mute - Trumpet, Straight, Humes and Berg
Model #101

26972

$0.00

EACH

Mute - Trumpet, Harmon B Model A1 wow-
WOW

34156

$0.00




EACH Blessing Trumpet Mouthpiece Silver 5C 51482 $0.00
EACH Trumpet, Bach TR500 23668 $359.97 | JTR710: Lacquered brass body, Alamo Music Center
.460 bore, 4.8 bell, stainless steel
pistons, JBM-TR7C mouthpiece,
wooden case
EACH Trumpet, Yamaha - YTR2330 23667 2538403 $415.00 | F.E. OLDS NTR110PC The Music Wagon
EACH MVTU Tuba Mouthpiece 38953 | s000/ |
EACH Tuba, Jupiter 378L Series, 3 Valve 3/4 BBb 26950 Jupiter JTU700L $2,349.00 | (Per factory availability) Taylor Music Inc.
(378L)

EACH Snark ST-8 Super Tight Clip-On, All Instrument | 34157 SNARKX $11.15 | Snark X Clip-on Tuner Shar Products
Tuner - 2784

EACH Korg Chromatic Tuner KT30 29578 KT30 $12.95 Shar Products

EACH Korg Chromatic Tuners, Model CA40 23831 KT50 $16.45 Shar Products

EACH Korg Combo Tuner Metronome KTM50 28436 KTM60 $23.95 Shar Products

- GS700AQRS

Kun Viola Shoulder Rest, fits 15" to 17" - Shar
1314

SRAVA4-4

Artino Full Size Viola Shoulder
Rest

EACH Ukulele, Cordoba 155M Soprano - MK-S Kala 23740 UK10NAT $29.95 | Ukan Soprano Ukulele with Bag, Shar Products
Each

SET Makala MK-S Soprano Ukulele Classroom Set, 55921 UK1ONAT $299.50 | Ukan Soprano Ukulele with Bag, Shar Products
Set of 10 Ukuleles - MK-S 10 PK Box of 10

SET Martin Standard ukulele strings - M600 51401 351462 $4.60 West Music

SET D'Addario EJ88B Nyltech Baritone Ukulele 34182 354611 $6.79 West Music
Strings

EACH Ukulele, Cordoba 15CM Concert - MK-C Kala 23739 303686 (MK-C) $59.32 West Music

EACH Ukulele, Mahalo Soprano, Painted with Bag - 26621 $0.00
U-30

SET Ukulele soprano strings by Aquila, Soprano Set | 55803 $0.00

Baroque Violin Shop




Thermoplastic Case, Fiberglass Bow - 106HT14

200 14" Viola Outfit with Prelude
Strings, Thermoplastic Case,
Glasser Fiberglass Bow and BVS
Rosin

EACH Viola Outfit - 14" Franz Hoffmann Amadeus, 26270 120VA14 $273.00 | Baroque Violin Shop Academy Baroque Violin Shop
Thermoplastic Case, Fiberglass Bow, Rosin - 200 14" Viola Outfit with Prelude
1005114 Strings, Thermoplastic Case,
Glasser Fiberglass Bow and BVS
Rosin
EACH Viola Outfit - 13" Franz Hoffmann Amadeus, 26829 120VA13 $273.00 | Baroque Violin Shop Academy Baroque Violin Shop
Thermoplastic Case, Fiberglass Bow, Rosin - 200 13" Viola Outfit with Prelude
1005113 Strings, Thermoplastic Case,
Glasser Fiberglass Bow and BVS
Rosin
EACH Viola Outfit - 12" Franz Hoffmann Amadeus, 27233 120VA12 $273.00 | Baroque Violin Shop Academy Baroque Violin Shop
Thermoplastic Case, Fiberglass Bow, Rosin - 200 12" Viola Outfit with Prelude
10058112 Strings, Thermoplastic Case,
Glasser Fiberglass Bow and BVS
Rosin
EACH 14" Viola, Klaus Mueller Prelude w/ 35781 120VA14 $273.00 | Baroque Violin Shop Academy Baroque Violin Shop

white horsehair.

SET String Set - 4/4 Viola Super Sensitive Red Label | 23682 SSSRLVAS14 $12.25 Baroque Violin Shop
- 303S

EACH Super-Sensitive Red Label Viola Strings, 303SH- | 55898 SSSRLVAS13 $12.25 Baroque Violin Shop
P, Size 13, Med, Steel wrap/core, Bell

EACH Super-Sensitive Red Label Viola Strings, 3035Q- | 55899 SSSRLVAS12 $12.25 Baroque Violin Shop
P, Size 12 Med, Steel wrap/core, Bell

EACH D'addario Prelude, 15" Viola String Set/String 51385 SDPVAS15 $16.00 Baroque Violin Shop

EACH Klaus Mueller Octagonal Brazilwood Violin 202416 KvB44 $17.95 | Schmidt Workshop Brazilwood Shar Products
Bow , VBCE , Southwest Strings Violin Bow 4/4 Size, Each

EACH Glasser Violin Bow - Size 4/4 - Fiberglass with | 23695 BVNFG4-4 $26.50 Baroque Violin Shop




EACH Glasser Violin Bow - Size 3/4 - Fiberglass with | 23696 BVNFG3-4 $26.50 Baroque Violin Shop
white horsehair - C202R34
EACH Glasser Violin Bow - Size 1/2 - Fiberglass with | 23697 BVNFG1-2 $26.50 Baroque Violin Shop
white horsehair - C202R12
EACH 3/4 Franz Hoffmann Etude Violin Outfit - 23693 120VN3-4 $268.99 | Baroque Violin Shop Academy Baroque Violin Shop
SV125WH 200 3/4 Violin Outfit with Prelude
Strings, Thermoplastic Case,
Glasser Fiberglass Bow and BVS
Rosin
EACH Violin Outfit, Size 1/2 Franz Hoffmann Etude, 26585 120VN1-2 $268.99 | Baroque Violin Shop Academy Baroque Violin Shop
Solid spruce and maple, Ebony Pegs, 200 1/2 Violin Outfit with Prelude
Fingerboard, Tailpiece and End Button, Four Strings, Thermoplastic Case,
String Adjusters and Four Quality Strings, Brazilwood Bow and BVS Rosin
Thermoplastic Case with a Brazilwood,
Horsehair Bow
EACH Violin Outfit, Size 4/4 Franz Hoffmann Etude, 26592 120VN4-4 $268.99 | Baroque Violin Shop Academy Baroque Violin Shop
Solid Spruce and Maple. Ebony Pegs, 200 4/4 Violin Outfit with Prelude
Fingerboard, Tailpiece and End Button, Four Strings, Thermoplastic Case,
String Adjusters and Four Quality Strings. Brazilwood Bow and BVS Rosin
Thermoplastic Case with a Brazilwood,
Horsehair Bow
EACH 4/4 violin klaus mueller etude thermoplastic 35782 120VN3-4 $268.99 | Baroque Violin Shop Academy Baroque Violin Shop
cage, Fiberglass bow 110HTF 200 4/4 Violin Outfit with Prelude
Strings, Thermoplastic Case,
Glasser Fiberglass Bow and BVS
Rosin
EACH 3/4 Shoulder Rest, Southwest Strings EVPM 202481 1399L $2.95 | zaret Shoulder Rest, Each Shar Products
EACH Shoulder Rest, Southwest Strings EVPS 202482 1399X $2.95 | Zaret Shoulder Rest, Each Shar Products
EACH Everest Violin Shoulder Rest (EZ Series) 4/4 38965 1338 44 $10.45 Shar Products
EACH Everest Violin Shoulder Rest (EZ Series) 3/4 38966 1338 34 $10.45 Shar Products
EACH Everest Violin Shoulder Rest 1/2-3/4 51491 133812 $10.45 Shar Products
EACH Kun Shoulder Rests 4/4 Violin - 1313 23704 SRAVN4-4 $15.00 | Artino 4/4 Violin Shoulder Rest Baroque Violin Shop
EACH 4/4 Violin Chinrest 34183 1124 $3.95 Shar Products




SET String Set - 1/2 Violin, Super-Sensitive Red 26599 299512M $10.55 Shar Products
Label - 299SH-P

SET String Set - 3/4 Violin, Super-Sensitive Red 26600 299S34M $10.55 Shar Products
Label - 299ST-P

SET String Set - 4/4 Violin, Super-Sensitive Red 26602 299544M $10.55 Shar Products
Label - 299SF-P

SET String Set - 3/4 Violin, Super-Sensitive Red 28433 299S34M $10.55 Shar Products
Label - Medium Gauge - 299S 34

SET String Set - 4/4 Violin, Super-Sensitive Red 28434 299544M $10.55 Shar Products
Label - Medium Gauge - 299S 44 M

SET String Set - 1/2 Violin, Super-Sensitive Red 29575 299512M $10.55 Shar Products
Label - Medium Gauge - 307S 12

EACH Bow - 3/4 Violin, Klaus Mueller Brazilwood, 26593 KvVB34 $17.95 | Schmidt Workshop Brazilwood Shar Products
Half Lined Ebony Frog with Pearl Eye and Violin Bow 3/4 Size, Each
Thumb Leather, Wire Winding - VBCT

EACH Bow Hold Buddies Violin/Viola Bow Grip, 55905 BHB BB $21.95 Shar Products
Things4Strings - Blue BHB-BB

EACH Bow Pinky Hold, Black Beauty - 50/Pkg - PHB50 | 55873 PHB50BLK $155.25 Shar Products
BLK

SET D'Addario Prelude 3/4 Violin Strings 51394 SVNDPS3-4 $11.00 Baroque Violin Shop

EACH Bow - 1/2 Violin, Glasser Fiberglass with White | 26587 BVNFG1-2 $26.50 Baroque Violin Shop
Horsehair

EACH Bow - 3/4 Violin, Glasser Fiberglass with White | 26589 BVNFG3-4 $26.50 Baroque Violin Shop
Horsehair

EACH Bow - 4/4 Violin, Glasser Fiberglass with White | 26590 BVNFG4-4 $26.50 Baroque Violin Shop
Horsehair

SET String Set - 3/4 Violin Prim 26601 $0.00 NO Bid

PKG Sonor ZS1 Black Pins for Xylophone - 10/Pkg 26996 261188 $6.08 West Music

EACH West Music, BB39 Stir Xylophone, 201766 202483 201766 $14.21 West Music

EACH Basic Beat BBOCS Soprano 35720 258690 $14.62 West Music
Xylophone/Metallophone Dust Cover

EACH Basic Beat BBOCB Bass 35719 258688 $16.11 West Music
Xylophone/Metallophone Dust Cover




